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information/disclosure-log?
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FOI_24-237 Executive Team, Pro Vice-Chancellor and Vice-Chancellor visits to China

Date of response: 02 October 2024

We have now considered your request of 04 September 2024 for the following information:

The number of visits to China in the last 18 months by the Vice-
Chancellor (or equivalent), any pro-VC (or equivalent), dean
international (or equivalent), or any other executive-level staff
(not academic or research staff). 

Please, for each visit, state the role of the staff member(s) who
went, and a list of meetings/itinerary.

Our response:

In the last 18 months, there were two visits to China, in the last 18 months, by our Vice-Chancellor, any Pro Vice-

Chancellor, dean international or any other executive level staff, not including academic or research staff:

Visit
Role of visiting

staff
List of meetings/itinerary

1 Vice-Chancellor

See accompanying document, our ref: FOI_24-237 Appendix A (/

documents/20142/576998/

FOI_24-237+Appendix+A+FINAL.pdf/3e114e48-67b7-c858-

e638-69616c235e37?t=1727866968584)
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Visit
Role of visiting

staff
List of meetings/itinerary

1

Pro Vice-

Chancellor

Faculty of Social

Sciences

Capital University of Economics and Business in Beijing, China from 10th  April

to 14th April 2024 on behalf of the Vice-Chancellor, for discussions regarding

Partner collaborative relations.

Attended a Study Abroad Forum, met with University of East Anglia regional

staff and attended an Activities Launch event, in Beijing.

Full itinerary: Information not held - s.1(1)(a), Freedom of Information Act

Information not held - s.1(1)(a), Freedom of Information Act

On this occasion it is not possible to provide all of the requested information. In line with your rights under section

1(1)(a) of the Act to be informed whether information is held, we confirm that the University does not hold any

recorded information for a full itinerary for the second visit to China by our previous Pro Vice-Chancellor for our

Faculty of social sciences. The full itinerary is no longer held by the University.

Furthermore, the Act contains several exemptions that allow public authorities to withhold certain information

from release. We have applied the following exemption to part of your request.

Exemption Reason

s.40(2), Personal

information  

Disclosure of some of the requested information would be contrary to the

requirements of the UK General Data Protection Regulation

 In line with s.40(2) of the Act we have removed certain personal data from FOI_24-237 Appendix A.

We believe that some of the requested information, specifically names of third parties, is the personal data of

those individuals, as defined by Article 4(1) of the UK General Data Protection Regulation (GDPR).  

We believe that disclosure of the personal information relating to these individuals would be contrary to the

requirements of Article 5(1)(a) of the GDPR; namely that information must be processed lawfully, fairly and in a

transparent manner. These individuals would have no expectation that this information would be made publicly

available, and we have not identified a lawful basis that would allow or require us to disclose this information.

Where information has been removed from the accompanying file we have replaced the text with a black

rectangle.

 

Make a request

To make a request for information not already published please contact the Information Compliance team at foi@uea.ac.uk (mailto:foi@uea.ac.uk) or view the Requests for

Information (/web/about/university-information/statutory-legal-policies/freedom-of-information/requests-for-information) page.

Please note that web and email addresses provided within the released documentation were correct at the time of disclosure. This means many links in the documentation

may subsequently be out of date.

© UEA. All rights reserved. University of East Anglia, Norwich Research Park, Norwich, Norfolk, NR4 7TJ, UK | +44 (0) 1603 456161

(https://

facebook.com/

ueaofficial)

(https://

twitter.com/

uniofeastanglia)

(https://

youtube.com/

user/

ueaofficial)

(https://

instagram.com/

uniofeastanglia)

(https://

www.tiktok.com/

@uniofeastanglia)

(https://

linkedin.com/

school/

university-of-

east-anglia/)
Accessibility (https://www.uea.ac.uk/about/university-information/statutory-and-legal/website) Legal Statements (https://www.uea.ac.uk/about/university-information/statutory-legal-policies)

Statement on Modern Slavery (https://www.uea.ac.uk/about/university-information/statutory-legal-policies/modern-slavery-statement)

Cookie Policy (https://www.uea.ac.uk/about/university-information/statutory-and-legal/data-protection/cookie-policy)

Data Protection (https://www.uea.ac.uk/about/university-information/statutory-and-legal/data-protection)

javascript:;
javascript:;
javascript:;
mailto:foi@uea.ac.uk
mailto:foi@uea.ac.uk
mailto:foi@uea.ac.uk
mailto:foi@uea.ac.uk
mailto:foi@uea.ac.uk
mailto:foi@uea.ac.uk
https://www.uea.ac.uk/web/about/university-information/statutory-legal-policies/freedom-of-information/requests-for-information
https://www.uea.ac.uk/web/about/university-information/statutory-legal-policies/freedom-of-information/requests-for-information
https://www.uea.ac.uk/web/about/university-information/statutory-legal-policies/freedom-of-information/requests-for-information
https://www.uea.ac.uk/web/about/university-information/statutory-legal-policies/freedom-of-information/requests-for-information
https://www.uea.ac.uk/web/about/university-information/statutory-legal-policies/freedom-of-information/requests-for-information
https://www.uea.ac.uk/web/about/university-information/statutory-legal-policies/freedom-of-information/requests-for-information
https://www.uea.ac.uk/web/about/university-information/statutory-legal-policies/freedom-of-information/requests-for-information
https://www.uea.ac.uk/web/about/university-information/statutory-legal-policies/freedom-of-information/requests-for-information
https://facebook.com/ueaofficial
https://facebook.com/ueaofficial
https://facebook.com/ueaofficial
https://facebook.com/ueaofficial
https://facebook.com/ueaofficial
https://facebook.com/ueaofficial
https://facebook.com/ueaofficial
https://facebook.com/ueaofficial
https://twitter.com/uniofeastanglia
https://twitter.com/uniofeastanglia
https://twitter.com/uniofeastanglia
https://twitter.com/uniofeastanglia
https://twitter.com/uniofeastanglia
https://twitter.com/uniofeastanglia
https://twitter.com/uniofeastanglia
https://twitter.com/uniofeastanglia
https://youtube.com/user/ueaofficial
https://youtube.com/user/ueaofficial
https://youtube.com/user/ueaofficial
https://youtube.com/user/ueaofficial
https://youtube.com/user/ueaofficial
https://youtube.com/user/ueaofficial
https://youtube.com/user/ueaofficial
https://youtube.com/user/ueaofficial
https://youtube.com/user/ueaofficial
https://instagram.com/uniofeastanglia
https://instagram.com/uniofeastanglia
https://instagram.com/uniofeastanglia
https://instagram.com/uniofeastanglia
https://instagram.com/uniofeastanglia
https://instagram.com/uniofeastanglia
https://instagram.com/uniofeastanglia
https://instagram.com/uniofeastanglia
https://www.tiktok.com/@uniofeastanglia
https://www.tiktok.com/@uniofeastanglia
https://www.tiktok.com/@uniofeastanglia
https://www.tiktok.com/@uniofeastanglia
https://www.tiktok.com/@uniofeastanglia
https://www.tiktok.com/@uniofeastanglia
https://www.tiktok.com/@uniofeastanglia
https://www.tiktok.com/@uniofeastanglia
https://linkedin.com/school/university-of-east-anglia/
https://linkedin.com/school/university-of-east-anglia/
https://linkedin.com/school/university-of-east-anglia/
https://linkedin.com/school/university-of-east-anglia/
https://linkedin.com/school/university-of-east-anglia/
https://linkedin.com/school/university-of-east-anglia/
https://linkedin.com/school/university-of-east-anglia/
https://linkedin.com/school/university-of-east-anglia/
https://linkedin.com/school/university-of-east-anglia/
https://linkedin.com/school/university-of-east-anglia/
https://www.uea.ac.uk/about/university-information/statutory-and-legal/website
https://www.uea.ac.uk/about/university-information/statutory-and-legal/website
https://www.uea.ac.uk/about/university-information/statutory-and-legal/website
https://www.uea.ac.uk/about/university-information/statutory-and-legal/website
https://www.uea.ac.uk/about/university-information/statutory-and-legal/website
https://www.uea.ac.uk/about/university-information/statutory-and-legal/website
https://www.uea.ac.uk/about/university-information/statutory-legal-policies
https://www.uea.ac.uk/about/university-information/statutory-legal-policies
https://www.uea.ac.uk/about/university-information/statutory-legal-policies
https://www.uea.ac.uk/about/university-information/statutory-legal-policies
https://www.uea.ac.uk/about/university-information/statutory-legal-policies
https://www.uea.ac.uk/about/university-information/statutory-legal-policies
https://www.uea.ac.uk/about/university-information/statutory-legal-policies/modern-slavery-statement
https://www.uea.ac.uk/about/university-information/statutory-legal-policies/modern-slavery-statement
https://www.uea.ac.uk/about/university-information/statutory-legal-policies/modern-slavery-statement
https://www.uea.ac.uk/about/university-information/statutory-legal-policies/modern-slavery-statement
https://www.uea.ac.uk/about/university-information/statutory-legal-policies/modern-slavery-statement
https://www.uea.ac.uk/about/university-information/statutory-legal-policies/modern-slavery-statement
https://www.uea.ac.uk/about/university-information/statutory-and-legal/data-protection/cookie-policy
https://www.uea.ac.uk/about/university-information/statutory-and-legal/data-protection/cookie-policy
https://www.uea.ac.uk/about/university-information/statutory-and-legal/data-protection/cookie-policy
https://www.uea.ac.uk/about/university-information/statutory-and-legal/data-protection/cookie-policy
https://www.uea.ac.uk/about/university-information/statutory-and-legal/data-protection/cookie-policy
https://www.uea.ac.uk/about/university-information/statutory-and-legal/data-protection/cookie-policy
https://www.uea.ac.uk/about/university-information/statutory-and-legal/data-protection
https://www.uea.ac.uk/about/university-information/statutory-and-legal/data-protection
https://www.uea.ac.uk/about/university-information/statutory-and-legal/data-protection
https://www.uea.ac.uk/about/university-information/statutory-and-legal/data-protection
https://www.uea.ac.uk/about/university-information/statutory-and-legal/data-protection
https://www.uea.ac.uk/about/university-information/statutory-and-legal/data-protection


Date Day Activity Staying in

10th Nov Weekend

Arrive in Shanghai - 10 Nov 12:30 LHR – 11 Nov 09:10 , British Airways - Hotel Pick up already arranged

Free time in Shanghai - 11th and 12th

Shanghai - : Hotel Bellagio by MGM

(David and )

13-Nov Monday

9:30am - Morning Briefing - (Hotel Bellagio lobby)

Key Agent visit Index Shanghai HQ including Lunch (VC,

10:30-11:30 Visit to Index Shanghai Headquarter meeting with founder of Index China,

11:30-13:00 Lunch with Index Shanghai

Key Agent visit - 51 Offer SH HQ - 14:30-15:30 (VC, )

6:30pm - Shanghai Evening Event - INTO / UEA Arranged - Agent Appreciation meal

Venue - Shanghai Peace Mansion (West Wuding Road)上海和平官邸（武定西路店）

Shanghai - : Hotel Bellagio by MGM

(David and )

14-Nov Tuesday

Key Agent Meeting ( to travel to central Shanghai)- Golden Arrow - (VC,

10:30-11:30: meeting with Founder of Golden Arrow, at Hotel Bellagio by MGM – on the bund

1pm-4pm & VC travel to Shanghai Uni of Technology(SIT) - Lunch and then meeting to discuss TNE

opportunities

4:30pm - UEA Business Development Office Opening Ceremony

Venue - Achieve Office in Shanghai - 3F, No.258, West Fuxing Road, Xuhui District, Shanghai, 200031

Evening Meal hosted by Business Development Office

Shanghai - : Hotel Bellagio by MGM

(Bund) (David and )

VC Vist to China - November 2023

-
-

- ---



15-Nov Wednesday

Travel from Shanghai to Beijing - High Speed Rail, depart 10am Shanghai Hongqiao - Arrive at 2:26pm Beijing South

Railway Station (Train booked by ) , and to travel on same train and have

both secured their train tickets)

5pm-5:30pm - VC mini speech to China teams on UEA 2030 strategy and China staff forum (INTO China recruitment

team, UEA China team including Business Development Office representatives)

Beijing Evening Event INTO Arranged - INTO / UEA agent appreciated meal.

Venue -北京华尔道夫酒店 Beijing Waldorf Astoria

Beijing - Park Hyatt (Guomao - Jinguomen

Wai Da Jie)

Beijing - Patk Hyatt (David and )

and will be staying at Crown

Plaza U-Town hotel

16-Nov Thursday

10:30AM - Visit to Capital University of Economics and Business (CUEB) - potential for new partnership - Visit with BDO

team - to include lunch

2:30pm- 3:30pm - CSCSE Visit and signing ceremony

5:30pm -Evening Meal (BDO organised)

Beijing - Park Hyatt (Guomao - Jinguomen

Wai Da Jie)

Beijing - Patk Hyatt (David and )

--- - - - -- -jtJliU~~~~Jis 

-



17-Nov Friday

9am 10am - Visit China Education Association for International Exchange (CEAIE) - XiCheng district

Key agent visit - EIC Beijing HQ, lunch with EIC (VC, -Jianwai Soho

10:30-11:30: meeting with EIC -

COO of EIC Education

Director of UK&Ireland Program Management Center EIC Education

Partner Officer of UK & Ireland Program Management Center（PMC）

11:30-13:00 Lunch with EIC

Walk accross Jianwai SOHO To JJL HQ

Key agent visit - JJL Beijing HQ visit: 1:30pm-2:30pm (VC, ) - Jianwei Soho

Chairman of JJL

Chief Operating Officer

Board Director Vice President

Director in Global Development Centre and TNE

Afternoon - 4:00pm-5:30pm - BLCU Beijing Language and Culture University Meeting and Student Meet-up (VC,

Beijing Language and Culture University Attendees:

BLCU Vice President

Director for International Cooperation and Exchange Office

Dean of International College

Programme Manager, International College

Free Evening

Beijing - Park Hyatt (Guomao - Jinguomen

Wai Da Jie)

Beijing - Patk Hyatt (David and )

18-Nov Saturday
Free Day Beijing - Patk Hyatt (David and )

19-Nov Sunday
Return to UK 19 Nov 12:10 DAX to LHR 17:30 (Taxi to be booked by VC at hotel)
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